
International day of Non Violence 
(Gandhi Jayanti) celebration

Hubballi: International day 
of Non Violence - Gandhi 
Jayanti celebration at Veda 



International School, 
Hubballi, Karnataka state.

The event aimed to honor 
the principles of non-
violence and the indelible 
legacy of Mahatma Gandhi.

The event featured various 
activities that echoed 
Gandhiji's ideals and 
teachings:

1. Swacch Bharat Abhiyan 
Remembrance:



Students and teachers 
commemorated Gandhiji's 
initiative, Swacch Bharat 
Abhiyan, underscoring the 
importance of cleanliness 
and hygiene in the society.

2. Salt Experiment 
Showcase:

A demonstration on 
evaporation and 
crystallization highlighted 
the crucial role of salt and its 
association with the historic 



Salt Satyagraha, 
emphasizing Gandhiji's 
peaceful resistance against 
unjust taxation imposed on 
salt.

3. Inspiring Gandhi Quotes:

The event showcased 
meaningful quotes by 
Mahatma Gandhi, 
encouraging reflection and 
fostering a deeper 
understanding of his 
philosophies.



4. Promoting Healthy Food 
Habits:

The students explored the 
significance of healthy food 
habits while addressing the 
issue of junk food, aligning 
with Gandhiji's emphasis on 
a balanced and wholesome 
lifestyle.

5. Khadi Gramodhaya 
Experience:



A visit to Khadi Gramodhaya 
was organized to educate 
the attendees about the 
importance of Khadi, an 
embodiment of Gandhiji's 
vision for self-sufficiency 
and sustainable living.

Students and teachers 
enthusiastically participated 
in the event, demonstrating 
their commitment to 
Gandhian values and non-
violent principles. Principal 



Beena John appreciated the 
active involvement and 
dedication shown by all 
participants.

The event provided a 
platform for the Veda 
International School 
community to reflect on the 
teachings of Mahatma 
Gandhi and actively work 
towards creating a more 
peaceful and harmonious 
society.










